



South Strabane Township Sanitary Authority
Floral Hill Drive Sewer Extension
Contract No. 2017-01
Bidders Tab
March 9, 2017 -- 2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR	SURETY/ AMOUNT	ADDENDUM NO. 1, 2, 3	BASE BIDAMOUNT	ALT 1 BID AMOUNT	ALT 2 BID AMOUNT
W.A. Petrakis Contracting Co. 1325 Frey Rd. Penn Hills, PA 15235	10%	Yes	\$164,462.00	\$175,030.00	No Bid
Strnisha Excavation, Inc. 109 Veronica Drive Canonsburg, PA 15317	10%	Yes	\$174,486.50	\$199,273.50	No Bid
J5 Construction 730 Woodlawn Drive Houston, PA 15342	10%	Yes	\$178,231.00	\$262,000.00	No Bid
John T. Subrick, Inc. 778 Thomas 84 Road Eighty Four, PA 15330	10%	Yes	\$212,000.00	\$228,205.00	No Bid
Alex E. Paris Contracting Company, Inc. 1595 Smith Township State Road P.O. Box 369 Atlasburg, PA 15004	10%	Yes	\$214,187.00	\$228,615.00	\$216,876.00
RJF Development Corp 1810 St. Rt. 819 Greensburg, PA 15601	10%	Yes	\$215,389.00	\$240,269.00	No Bid
Pollard Land Services, Inc. 8150 Franklin Road Girard, PA 16417	10%	Yes	\$225,753.00	\$266,845.00	\$225,753.00
Graziani Construction, Inc. 1050 Frew Mill Road New Castle, PA 16101	10%	Yes	\$242,523.00	\$265,875.00	\$169,000.00
R & B Contracting & Excavation, Inc. 4821 Buttermilk Hollow Road West Mifflin, PA 15122	10%	Yes	\$260,087.00	\$264,615.00	\$209,408.00
Continental Construction, Inc. PO Box 126 Ridgway, PA 15853	10%	1, 2	\$288,687.00	\$372,435.00	\$271,095.00
D & M Contracting, Inc. 1868 Lions Club Road New Alexandria, PA 15670	10%	Yes	\$293,000.00	\$320,000.00	\$390,524.00
FOGLE CONSTRUCTION LLC 604 DIAMOND STREET BERLIN, PA 15530	10%	Yes	\$320,240.00	\$344,500.00	No Bid
Ligonier Construction POB 277 1350 ROUTE 30 Laughlintown, PA 15655	10%	Yes	\$325,000.00	\$329,000.00	\$336,067.00
Fleeher Contracting, LLC 31 Windcrest Drive Cecil, PA 15321	10%	Yes	\$440,471.00	\$475,289.00	No Bid