



**MOON TOWNSHIP MUNICIPAL AUTHORITY
LANG DRIVE & SHAFER ROAD WATERLINE REPLACEMENT**

Contract No. 04-2018

Bidders Tab

May 31, 2018 -- 2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR	SURETY/ AMOUNT	ADDENDUM NO. 1, 2	OPTION 1 BID AMOUNT	OPTION 2 BID AMOUNT	OPTION 3 BID AMOUNT	OPTION 4 BID AMOUNT
Anton Mechanical 531 Thorncliffe Drive Pittsburgh, PA 15205			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Casper Colosimo & Son Inc. 5170 Campbells Run Rd. Pittsburgh, PA 15205	10%	Yes	\$717,015.00	\$417,400.00	\$743,180.00	\$422,090.00
Glenn Johnston, Inc. 1055 Center Street McKeesport, PA 15132	10%	Yes	\$809,269.00	\$539,365.00	No Bid	No Bid
JET JACK INC 5020 THOMS RUN ROAD OAKDALE, PA 15071	10%	Yes	\$757,075.00	\$596,294.00	\$782,137.50	\$690,203.00
Stefanik's Next Generation Contracting 2267 Todd Road Aliquippa, PA 15001	10%	Yes	\$675,768.00	\$493,445.00	\$762,415.00	\$531,279.00
W.A. Petrakis Contracting Co. 5034 Sequoia Court Export, PA 15632	10%	Yes	\$754,315.00	\$428,720.00	No Bid	No Bid

