



**O'Hara Township**  
**Powers Run / Village & Dorseyville Sanitary Sewer Project**  
**Contract No. 2019-02A, B**  
**Bidders Tab**  
**October 15, 2019 -- 4:00 PM**

CONTRACTOR	SURETY/ AMOUNT	ADDENDUM NO. 1, 2, 3	Upper Powers Run Sanitary Sewer	Village Dr. / Dorseyville Rd. Sanitary Sewer
A. Folino Construction, Inc. 109 Dark Hollow Road Oakmont, PA 15139	No Bid			
Bella Enterprises Inc 1446 Smith Twp State Road Burgettstown, PA 15021	No Bid			
Chivers Construction Co, Inc. 6700 Tow Road Fairview, PA 16415	10%	✓	\$398,347.00	\$211,210.00
D & M Contracting, Inc. 1868 Lions Club Road New Alexandria, PA 15670	10%	✓	\$488,000.00	\$220,000.00
Glenn Johnston, Inc. 1055 Center Street McKeesport, PA 15132	10%	✓	\$465,794.00	\$193,904.00
Greenland Const., Inc. 8908 Clearfield-Curwensville Hwy. Clearfield, PA 16830	10%	✓	\$571,000.00	\$225,509.00
Hosey Excavation Services, LLC 920 Thompson Run Rd Harwick, PA 15049	No Bid			
Iron City Excavating 740 Freedom Crider Road Freedom, PA 15042	No Bid			
Jet Jack 5020 Thoms Run Road Oakdale, PA 15071	10%	✓	\$573,802.00	\$186,305.80
Ligonier Construction 1350 ROUTE 30 Laughlintown, PA 15655	10%	✓	\$449,500.00	\$195,310.00
North Beaver Contracting 4321 Edinburg Road New Castle, PA 16102	10%	✓	\$339,463.00	\$158,975.00

OSIRIS ENTERPRISES 946 Angelo Drive PITTSBURGH, PA 15236	No Bid			
Pollard Land Services, Inc. 8150 Franklin Road Girard, PA 16417	No Bid			
S&E Utility Contracting, Inc. 253 Waugaman Road Harrison City, PA 15636	No Bid			
Terra Works Inc. 49 South Sheridan Road PO Box 189 Clarion, PA 16214	10%	✓	\$493,435.00	\$239,052.00
W.A. Petrakis Contracting Co. 5034 Sequoia Court Export, PA 15632	10%	✓	\$290,635.00	\$170,967.00