



**Creswell Heights Joint Authority**  
**Croxall Avenue Water Main, Spring Run Road Waterline, Woodbine Road Waterline**  
**Contract No. 2019-02,03,04**  
**Bidders Tab**  
**March 16, 2020 - 6:00 PM**

CONTRACTOR	SURETY/ AMOUNT	ADDENDUM NO. 1, 2 (2019-02, 03)	ADDENDUM NO. 1 (2019-04)	CONTRACT 2019-02 TOTAL BID AMOUNT	CONTRACT 2019-03 TOTAL BID AMOUNT	CONTRACT 2019-04 TOTAL BID AMOUNT	Combinations Bid			
Cicccone Construction 507 East Drive Aliquippa, PA 15001				No Bid			No Bid			
CTM Construction 351 11th Street Monaca, PA 15061	10%	1, 2	1	\$155,760.00	\$119,250.00	\$395,020.00	02/03/04 \$4,672.80 \$3,577.50 \$15,800.80	02/03 \$4,672.80 \$3,577.50	03/04 \$3,577.50 \$15,800.80	02/04 \$4,672.80 \$15,800.80
Glenn Johnston, Inc. 1055 Center Street McKeesport, PA 15132	10%	1, 2	1	\$153,068.00	\$144,895.00	\$362,048.00	2/3/2004 \$1,530.68 \$1,448.95 \$3,620.48	02/03 No Bid	03/04 \$724.48 \$1,810.24	02/04 \$765.34 \$1,810.24
Gregor Contracting 266 Renfrew Road Renfrew, PA 16053	10%	1, 2	No	\$233,954.00	\$211,650.00	No Bid	No Bid			
Golden Triangle Construction Company 8555 Old Steubenville Pike Imperial, PA 15126				No Bid			No Bid			
Iron City Excavating 740 Freedom Crider Road Freedom, PA 15042	10%	No	No	\$186,040.00	\$178,900.00	\$405,100.00	No Bid			
Jet Jack, Inc. 5020 Thoms Run Road Oakdale, PA 15071	10%	1, 2	1	\$168,905.00	\$161,950.00	\$541,430.00	02/03/04 \$3,378.10 \$3,329.00 \$10,828.60	02/03 \$1,689.05 \$1,619.50	03/04 \$1,619.50 \$5,414.30	02/04 \$1,689.05 \$5,414.30
L E B Contracting Inc, 703 State Route 170 East Palestine, OH 44413	10%	1, 2	1	\$183,621.00	\$140,000.00	\$408,407.00	No Bid			
M O'Herron 4002 Lorigan St Pittsburgh, PA 15224	10%	1, 2	1	\$156,558.80	\$118,020.00	\$439,274.00	No Bid			
Meyer Excavating, Inc. 2045 Old State Road Gibsonia, PA 15044	10%	1, 2	No	\$137,539.00	\$124,999.00	No Bid	No Bid			
North Beaver Contracting 4321 Edinburg Road New Castle, PA 16102	10%	1, 2	1	\$126,570.00	\$115,105.00	\$393,960.00	No Bid			
S.E.T., Inc. 235 East Water Street Lowellville, OH 44436	10%	1	1	\$181,985.70	\$143,091.07	\$429,195.00	No Bid			
STRNISHA EXCAVATION INC 109 Veronica Drive Canonsburg, PA 15317	10%	1, 2	No	\$148,988.05	\$143,873.00	No Bid	No Bid			
Valley Brook Services 1886 Union Valley Road Wampum, PA 16157	10%	1, 2	No	\$155,707.21	\$109,816.75	No Bid	No Bid			
W.A. Petrakis Contracting Co. 1501 Pontiac Ct Export, PA 15632				No Bid			No Bid			
X-Press Underground, Inc. 11640 S. Stateline Road Petersburg, OH 44454	10%	1, 2	1	\$182,928.00	\$114,550.00	\$328,428.00	02/03/04 \$3,658.56 \$2,291.00 \$6,568.56	02/03 \$1,829.28 \$1,145.50	03/04 \$1,145.50 \$3,284.28	02/04 \$1,829.28 \$3,284.28