



Richland Township Municipal Authority
Gibson Road and Van Velsor Drive Waterline Replacement
Contract No. 2020-01A, 01B
Bidders Tab
September 10, 2020 -- 2:00 PM

CONTRACTOR	SURETY/ AMOUNT	ADDENDUM NO. 1	2020-01A TOTAL BID AMOUNT	2020-01A DIRECTIONAL DRILLING DEDUCT	2020-01B TOTAL BID AMOUNT	2020-01B DIRECTIONAL DRILLING DEDUCT
A. Folino Construction, Inc. 109 Dark Hollow Road Oakmont, PA 15139	10%	✓	\$ 307,307.00	\$ -	\$ 520,520.00	\$ -
Albert Tarr Excavating, Inc. 3810 Shepard Rd Gibsonia, PA 15044	No Bid					
Bella Enterprises, Inc. 598 Vanceville Road Eighty Four, PA 15330	10%	✓	\$ 243,900.00	\$ -	\$ 411,375.00	\$ -
D & M Contracting, Inc. 1868 Lions Club Road New Alexandria, PA 15670	10%	✓	\$ 247,000.00	\$ -	\$ 398,000.00	\$ -
Glenn Johnston, Inc. 1055 Center Street McKeesport, PA 15132	10%	✓	\$ 215,305.00	\$ -	\$ 367,437.00	\$ -
Guyer Brothers, Inc. 1481 Salemville Road New Enterprise, PA 16664	10%	✓	\$ 254,030.00	\$ -	\$ 410,420.00	\$ -
Jet Jack, Inc. 5020 Thoms Run Road Oakdale, PA 15071	10%	✓	\$ 256,670.50	\$ -	\$ 427,575.00	\$ -
JR CONTRACTING, LLC 499 CARLTON DRIVE BENTLEYVILLE, PA 15314	10%	✓	\$ 210,866.00	\$ -	\$ 345,997.00	\$ -
JS BOVA EXCAVATING, LLC 235 STATE ST., PO BOX 296 STRUTHERS, OH 44471	10%	✓	\$ 252,165.00	\$ -	\$ 393,226.00	\$ -
Kukurin Contracting, Inc. 1169 Route 286 Export, PA 15632	10%	✓	\$ 359,359.00	\$ 90,090.00	\$ 533,335.00	\$ 146,652.00
LEB Contracting 1203 State Route 170 East Palestine, OH 44413	10%	✓	\$ 368,675.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 606,370.00	\$ 20,000.00

M. O'HERRON COMPANY 4002 LORIGAN ST PITTSBURGH, PA 15224	10%	✓	\$ 237,585.00	\$ -	\$ 371,470.00	\$ 7,500.00
Mortimers Excavating Inc. 523 lapin lane pulaski, PA 16143	10%	✓	\$ 234,880.00	\$ -	\$ 386,465.00	\$ -
North Beaver Contracting 4321 Edinburg Road New Castle, PA 16102	10%	✓	\$ 235,750.00	\$ -	\$ 369,340.00	\$ -
Reed Construction Data 30 Technology Pakrway South, Suite 100 Norcross, GA 33092	No Bid					
RJF Devlopement Corp 1810state route 819 Greensburg, PA 15601	No Bid					
Rudzik Excavating, Inc. 401 Lowellville Road Struthers, OH 44471	10%	✓	\$ 249,200.00	\$ -	\$ 409,370.00	\$ -
S&E Utility Contracting, Inc. 253 Waugaman Road Harrison City, PA 15636	No Bid					
Sciarretti Site Development & Paving Company Inc 812 Halket Street Braddock, PA 15104	No Bid					
Stefanik's Next Generation Contracting 2267 Todd Road Aliquippa, PA 15001	10%	✓	\$ 289,205.00	\$ -	\$ 464,745.00	\$ -
Terra Works, Inc. 49 S. Sheridan Road Clarion, PA 16214	No Bid					
W.A. Petrakis Contracting Co. 1501 Pontiac Ct Export, PA 15632	10%	✓	\$ 241,075.00	\$ -	\$ 380,030.00	\$ -
X-Press Underground, Inc. 11640 S. Stateline Road Petersburg, OH 44454	\$590,000	✓	\$ 265,080.00	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 434,820.00	\$ 40,000.00