



**Elizabeth Township Sanitary  
Elizabeth to McKeesport Force Main  
Contract No. 2020-01, 01A  
Bidders Tab  
August 31, 2020 -- 6:30 PM**

CONTRACTOR	SURETY/ AMOUNT	ADDENDA NO. 1, 2, 3, 4	TOTAL BID AMOUNT 2020-01	TOTAL BID AMOUNT 2020-01A	COMBINATION BID DEDUCT
A. Merante Contracting, Inc. 4740 Streets Run Road Pittsburgh, PA 15236	10%	Y	\$4,357,554.00	\$5,096,665.50	\$100,000
Advanced Builders 321 Cobble Lane Belle Vernon, PA 15012	10%	Y	\$5,714,700.00 (-\$1,540,000.00)	\$5,820,576.00 (-\$909,000.00)	\$200,000
Alex E. Paris Contracting Company, Inc. 1595 Smith Township State Road P.O. Box 369 Atlasburg, PA 15004	10%	Y	\$3,790,887.00	\$3,969,537.00	No Bid
Chivers Construction Co, Inc. 6700 Tow Road Fairview, PA 16415	10%	Y	\$3,840,727.00	\$4,227,136.00	\$75,000.00
D & M Contracting, Inc. 1868 Lions Club Road New Alexandria, PA 15670	10%	Y	\$3,673,000.00	\$4,497,000.00	\$50,000.00
Glenn Johnston, Inc. 1055 Center Street McKeesport, PA 15132	10%	Y	\$4,010,147.00	\$4,668,443.00	\$86,524.00
Golden Triangle Construction Company 8555 Old Steubenville Pike Imperial, PA 15126				No Bid	
Graziani Construction, Inc. 1050 Frew Mill Road New Castle, PA 16101	10%	Y	\$3,864,019.00	No Bid	
Greenland Const., Inc. 8908 Clearfield-Curwensville Hwy. Clearfield, PA 16830				No Bid	
Guyer Brothers, Inc. 1481 Salemville Road New Enterprise, PA 16664	10%	Y	\$3,515,000.00	No Bid	
Independence Excavating, Inc. 5720 E Schaaf Rd Independence, OH 44131	10%	Y	\$4,540,390.00	No Bid	
Jet Jack, Inc. 5020 Thoms Run Road Oakdale, PA 15071	10%	Y	\$4,125,465.00	\$4,382,683.00	\$127,622.22
JR CONTRACTING, LLC 499 CARLTON DRIVE BENTLEYVILLE, PA 15314	10%	Y	\$3,409,056.00	\$4,973,529.00	No Bid
Kukurin Contracting, Inc. 1169 Route 286 Export, PA 15632	10%	Y	\$4,258,258.00	\$4,917,719.00	\$49,177.19 -01A \$42,582.58 -01
M. O'HERRON COMPANY 4002 LORIGAN ST PITTSBURGH, PA 15224				No Bid	
Macson Corporation 2100 Rt 51 South Large, PA 15025	10%	Y	\$4,311,673.00	No Bid	
Mele Mechanical LLC Four Mele Place Rankin, PA 15104	10%	Y	\$4,355,620.93	\$4,916,261.89	\$100,000.00
Michael Facchiano Contracting Inc. 801 McNeilly Rd # 4 Pittsburgh, PA 15226				No Bid	
Mortimer's Excavating Inc 523 Lapin Lane Pulaski, PA 16143	10%	Y	\$4,350,004.00	\$5,237,492.00	No Bid

Pipelines, Inc 4900 Grand Avenue Neville Island Pittsburgh, PA 15225			No Bid		
Pro Contracting Inc 681 Hawk Highway Lost Creek, WV 26385			No Bid		
S J Louis Construction Inc 1351 Broadway Street W Rockville, MN 56369			No Bid		
S&E Utility Contracting, Inc. 253 Waugaman Road Harrison City, PA 15636			No Bid		
S.E.T., Inc. 235 East Water Street Lowellville, OH 44436			No Bid		
Snyder Environmental Services, Inc. 270 Industrial Blvd Kearneysville, WV 25430			No Bid		
Underground Solutions 14611 Fairburn Street Poway, CA 92064			No Bid		
W.A. Petrakis Contracting Co. 1501 Pontiac Ct Export, PA 15632	10%	Y	\$2,964,289.50	\$3,173,035.50	\$4,000.00
X-Press Underground, Inc. 11640 S. Stateline Road Petersburg, OH 44454			No Bid		