



**Borough of Sewickley Water Authority
 Quaker Hollow - Pink House Waterline Replacement
 Contract No. 2021-02
 Bidders Tab
 May 18, 2021 -- 2:00 PM**

CONTRACTOR	SURETY/ AMOUNT	ADDENDA NO. 1	TOTAL BID AMOUNT BASE BID	TOTAL BID AMOUNT BID ALT. 1
Alex E. Paris Contracting Company, Inc. 1595 Smith Township State Road Atlasburg, PA 15004	10%	Yes	\$258,395.00	\$275,095.00
Bella Enterprises Inc 1446 Smith Twp State Road Burgettstown, PA 15021	10%	Yes	\$217,635.00	\$239,195.00
Continental Construction Inc 39144 Portlandmills Rd. RIDGWAY, PA 15853	10%	Yes	\$295,140.00	\$311,695.00
CTM Construction 351 11th Street Monaca, PA 15061	10%	Yes	\$235,550.00	\$252,250.00
D & M Contracting, Inc. 1868 Lions Club Road New Alexandria, PA 15670	No Bid			
Gregor Contracting 266 Renfrew Road Renfrew, PA 16053	10%	Yes	\$167,578.35	\$182,807.00
Iron City Excavating 740 Freedom Crider Road Freedom, PA 15042	10%	Yes	\$197,000.00	\$220,700.00
Jet Jack, Inc. 5020 Thoms Run Road Oakdale, PA 15071	10%	Yes	\$260,190.00	\$288,480.00
JS Bova Excavating 235 State Street Struthers, OH 44471	10%	Yes	\$250,708.00	\$268,572.00
Mortimer's Excavating.com 523 LAPIN LANE Pulaski, PA 16143	No Bid			
Rudzik Excavating, Inc. 401 Lowellville Road Struthers, OH 44471	10%	Yes	\$240,079.63	\$256,652.73

Sharon Paving & Construction Co, Inc. 100 Canal Street Sharpsville, PA 16150	10%	Yes	\$297,744.09	\$316,493.00
Stefanik's Next Generation Contracting 2267 Todd Road Aliquippa, PA 15001	10%	Yes	\$277,853.00	\$307,043.00
W.A. Petrakis Contracting Co. 1501 Pontiac Ct Export, PA 15632	10%	Yes	\$234,160.00	\$250,025.00
W.M. Aiken & Son P.O. Box 424 Mars, PA 16046	No Bid			
X-Press Underground, Inc. 11640 S. Stateline Road Petersburg, OH 44454	No Bid			