



Creswell Heights Joint Authority
Crescent Blvd. Ext. Water Main Replacement
Contract No. 2022-01
Bidders Tab
January 16, 2023 -- 10:00 AM

CONTRACTOR	SURETY/ AMOUNT	ADDENDA NO. 1	BASE BID AMOUNT	ADD-ON BID AMOUNT
A. Merante Contracting 4740 Streets Run Road Pittsburgh, PA 15236			No Bid	
Chivers Construction Co, Inc. 6700 Tow Road Fairview, PA 16415			No Bid	
CTM Construction 351 11th Street Monaca, PA 15061	10%	Yes	\$496,545.00	\$70,290.00
D & M Contracting, Inc. 1868 Lions Club Road New Alexandria, PA 15670	10%	Yes	\$487,000.00	\$93,000.00
Dragun Contracting 860 Parkview Blvd pittsburgh, PA 15215			No Bid	
Jet Jack Inc. 5020 Thoms Run Road Oakdale, PA 15071			No Bid	
JS Bova Excavating 235 State Street Struthers, OH 44471	10%	Yes	\$708,205.00	\$129,215.00
Mele & Mele & Sons Inc. One Mele Place Braddock PA 15104			No Bid	
National Road Utility Supply, Inc. 197 Alter Road Natrona Heights, PA 15065			No Bid	
North Beaver Contracting 4321 Edinburg Road New Castle, PA 16102	10%	Yes	\$420,335.00	\$62,845.00
Preferred Plumbing And Heating Solutions LLC 246 Pittsburgh Grade Rd. Hookstown, PA 15050	10%	Yes	\$587,380.00	\$94,998.00
S&E Utility Contracting, Inc. 253 Waugaman Road Harrison City, PA 15636			No Bid	
S.E.T., Inc. 235 East Water Street Lowellville, OH 44436	10%	Yes	\$586,064.90	\$105,269.35
Sanner Masonry & Excavation Inc 155 Warehouse Road Rockwood, PA 15557			No Bid	
W.A. Petrakis Contracting Co. 1501 Pontiac Ct Export, PA 15632	10%	Yes	\$585,075.00	\$96,840.00
X-Press Underground, Inc. 11640 S. Stateline Road Petersburg, OH 44454	10%	Yes	\$665,988.00	\$113,465.00