

		aris Contracting Comp			Phase 2 Site Contract			Boney Construction LL			D&M Contracting, Inc.			Angle Construction Co			S. Bova Excavating LL			JET JACK		Iukurin Contracting, In		he Pine Construction, I		M. O'Herron Company		ortimers Excavating H		EXCAVATING - STRUTH		o Excavating and Pavi		Petrakis Contracting,	
	Total Cost Selected # Selected (\$)	Unit	Mea	Quantity	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost			
1 Base Bid Pricing - Leopold Lane (27)																																			
#1-1	FALSE	6" C909 PV	\$	510	\$ 245	\$ 124,950.0	\$ 66.24	\$ 33,782.39	\$ 52	\$ 26,520.0	\$ 72	\$ 36,720.0	\$ 165	\$ 84,150.0	\$ 132	\$ 67,320.0	\$ 120	\$ 61,200.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 174.44	\$ 88,964.4	\$ 178	\$ 90,780.0	\$ 86	\$ 43,860.0	\$ 75	\$ 38,250.0	\$ 58	\$ 29,580.0	\$ 86	\$ 43,860.0			
#1-2	FALSE	2" HDPE Pi	\$	290	\$ 80	\$ 23,200.0	\$ 41.61	\$ 12,066.9	\$ 31	\$ 8,990.0	\$ 53	\$ 15,370.0	\$ 49	\$ 14,210.0	\$ 50	\$ 14,500.0	\$ 40	\$ 11,600.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 148	\$ 42,920.0	\$ 81	\$ 23,490.0	\$ 64	\$ 18,560.0	\$ 47	\$ 13,630.0	\$ 35	\$ 10,150.0	\$ 76	\$ 22,040.0			
#1-3	FALSE	6" Gate Va	\$	2	\$ 1,450.0	\$ 2,900.0	\$ 1,610.71	\$ 3,221.42	\$ 2,250.0	\$ 4,500.0	\$ 2,165.0	\$ 4,330.0	\$ 3,200.0	\$ 6,400.0	\$ 2,332.0	\$ 4,664.0	\$ 2,000.0	\$ 4,000.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5,475.0	\$ 10,950.0	\$ 1,445.0	\$ 2,890.0	\$ 24	\$ 48	\$ 2,239.0	\$ 4,478.0	\$ 2,900.0	\$ 5,800.0	\$ 2,210.0	\$ 4,420.0			
#1-4	FALSE	D. I. M. J. F	\$	2	\$ 750	\$ 1,500.0	\$ 782.11	\$ 1,564.22	\$ 1,200.0	\$ 2,400.0	\$ 1,050.0	\$ 2,100.0	\$ 1,600.0	\$ 3,200.0	\$ 1,420.0	\$ 2,840.0	\$ 500	\$ 1,000.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,706.0	\$ 7,412.0	\$ 460	\$ 920	\$ 670	\$ 1,340.0	\$ 1,322.0	\$ 2,644.0	\$ 1,350.0	\$ 2,700.0	\$ 1,845.0	\$ 3,690.0			
#1-5	FALSE	D. I. M. J. F	\$	1	\$ 1,000.0	\$ 1,000.0	\$ 621.51	\$ 621.51	\$ 1,000.0	\$ 1,000.0	\$ 695	\$ 695	\$ 1,100.0	\$ 1,100.0	\$ 995	\$ 995	\$ 500	\$ 500	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,354.0	\$ 1,354.0	\$ 460	\$ 460	\$ 600	\$ 600	\$ 1,011.0	\$ 1,011.0	\$ 860	\$ 860	\$ 925	\$ 925			
#1-6	FALSE	D. I. M. J. F	\$	5	\$ 690	\$ 3,450.0	\$ 534.88	\$ 2,674.4	\$ 750	\$ 3,750.0	\$ 670	\$ 3,350.0	\$ 1,100.0	\$ 5,500.0	\$ 974	\$ 4,870.0	\$ 500	\$ 2,500.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,160.0	\$ 5,800.0	\$ 460	\$ 2,300.0	\$ 600	\$ 3,000.0	\$ 991	\$ 4,955.0	\$ 860	\$ 4,300.0	\$ 900	\$ 4,500.0			
#1-7	FALSE	D. I. M. J. F	\$	1	\$ 690	\$ 690	\$ 599.92	\$ 599.92	\$ 750	\$ 750	\$ 670	\$ 670	\$ 1,100.0	\$ 1,100.0	\$ 974	\$ 974	\$ 500	\$ 500	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,160.0	\$ 1,160.0	\$ 460	\$ 460	\$ 600	\$ 600	\$ 991	\$ 991	\$ 860	\$ 860	\$ 900	\$ 900			
#1-8	FALSE	D. I. M. J. F	\$	1	\$ 420	\$ 420	\$ 303.22	\$ 303.22	\$ 850	\$ 850	\$ 460	\$ 460	\$ 925	\$ 925	\$ 1,257.0	\$ 1,257.0	\$ 400	\$ 400	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,217.0	\$ 1,217.0	\$ 460	\$ 460	\$ 500	\$ 500	\$ 1,119.0	\$ 1,119.0	\$ 750	\$ 750	\$ 765	\$ 765			
#1-9	FALSE	3/4" Corp.	\$	4	\$ 1,200.0	\$ 4,800.0	\$ 1,442.7	\$ 5,770.8	\$ 500	\$ 2,000.0	\$ 1,140.0	\$ 4,560.0	\$ 5,000.0	\$ 20,000.0	\$ 1,482.0	\$ 5,928.0	\$ 750	\$ 3,000.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,587.0	\$ 10,348.0	\$ 4,000.0	\$ 16,000.0	\$ 1,375.0	\$ 5,500.0	\$ 929	\$ 3,716.0	\$ 1,400.0	\$ 5,600.0	\$ 2,855.0	\$ 11,420.0			
#1-10	FALSE	3/4" Copp	\$	70	\$ 50	\$ 3,500.0	\$ 48.02	\$ 3,361.4	\$ 30	\$ 2,100.0	\$ 39.5	\$ 2,765.0	\$ 21	\$ 1,470.0	\$ 38	\$ 2,660.0	\$ 75	\$ 5,250.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 130	\$ 9,100.0	\$ 105	\$ 7,350.0	\$ 48	\$ 3,360.0	\$ 87	\$ 6,090.0	\$ 52	\$ 3,640.0	\$ 34	\$ 2,380.0			
#1-11	FALSE	Meter Put	\$	4	\$ 1,100.0	\$ 4,400.0	\$ 1,487.71	\$ 5,950.84	\$ 3,000.0	\$ 12,000.0	\$ 1,240.0	\$ 4,960.0	\$ 4,500.0	\$ 18,000.0	\$ 2,046.0	\$ 8,184.0	\$ 1,200.0	\$ 4,800.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,916.0	\$ 11,664.0	\$ 1,915.0	\$ 7,660.0	\$ 1,250.0	\$ 5,000.0	\$ 2,850.0	\$ 11,400.0	\$ 12,000.0	\$ 48,000.0	\$ 1,450.0	\$ 5,800.0			
#1-12	FALSE	New Fire H	\$	2	\$ 8,200.0	\$ 16,400.0	\$ 6,907.43	\$ 13,814.86	\$ 9,500.0	\$ 19,000.0	\$ 8,665.0	\$ 17,330.0	\$ 10,000.0	\$ 20,000.0	\$ 7,800.0	\$ 15,600.0	\$ 8,000.0	\$ 16,000.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12,700.5	\$ 25,401.12	\$ 9,700.0	\$ 19,400.0	\$ 6,970.0	\$ 13,940.0	\$ 9,425.0	\$ 18,850.0	\$ 10,900.0	\$ 21,800.0	\$ 10,940.0	\$ 21,880.0			
#1-13	FALSE	Concrete T	\$	10	\$ 220	\$ 2,200.0	\$ 415.64	\$ 4,156.4	\$ 50	\$ 500	\$ 25	\$ 250	\$ 250	\$ 2,500.0	\$ 171	\$ 1,710.0	\$ 200	\$ 2,000.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 143	\$ 1,430.0	\$ 165	\$ 1,650.0	\$ 150	\$ 1,500.0	\$ 180	\$ 1,800.0	\$ 350	\$ 3,500.0	\$ 150	\$ 1,500.0			
#1-14	FALSE	Asphalt Tr	\$	50	\$ 42	\$ 2,100.0	\$ 143.99	\$ 7,199.5	\$ 100	\$ 5,000.0	\$ 62	\$ 3,100.0	\$ 210	\$ 10,500.0	\$ 40	\$ 2,000.0	\$ 90	\$ 4,500.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 59	\$ 2,950.0	\$ 220	\$ 11,000.0	\$ 230	\$ 11,500.0	\$ 87	\$ 4,350.0	\$ 75	\$ 3,750.0	\$ 57.25	\$ 2,862.5			
#1-15	FALSE	Select Bac	\$	300	\$ 66	\$ 19,800.0	\$ 73.48	\$ 22,044.0	\$ 48	\$ 14,400.0	\$ 46.5	\$ 13,950.0	\$ 64	\$ 19,200.0	\$ 55	\$ 16,500.0	\$ 35	\$ 10,500.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 72	\$ 21,600.0	\$ 1.1	\$ 330.0	\$ 72	\$ 21,600.0	\$ 61	\$ 18,300.0	\$ 59	\$ 17,700.0	\$ 52	\$ 15,600.0			
#1-16	FALSE	E&S Contr	\$	1	\$ 3,300.0	\$ 3,300.0	\$ 3,536.54	\$ 3,536.54	\$ 3,000.0	\$ 3,000.0	\$ 650	\$ 650	\$ 6,000.0	\$ 6,000.0	\$ 522	\$ 522	\$ 1,500.0	\$ 1,500.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6,757.0	\$ 6,757.0	\$ 1,650.0	\$ 1,650.0	\$ 2,000.0	\$ 2,000.0	\$ 4,405.0	\$ 4,405.0	\$ 15,000.0	\$ 15,000.0	\$ 1,500.0	\$ 1,500.0			
#1-17	FALSE	Miss Mark	\$	4	\$ 1,900.0	\$ 7,600.0	\$ 1,401.5	\$ 5,606.0	\$ 1,000.0	\$ 4,000.0	\$ 25	\$ 100	\$ 2,250.0	\$ 9,000.0	\$ 250	\$ 900	\$ 750	\$ 3,000.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 518	\$ 2,072.0	\$ 1,700.0	\$ 6,800.0	\$ 2,000.0	\$ 8,000.0	\$ 250	\$ 1,000.0	\$ 2,000.0	\$ 8,000.0	\$ 200	\$ 800			
#1-18	FALSE	Explorator	\$	1	\$ 1,600.0	\$ 1,600.0	\$ 1,401.5	\$ 1,401.5	\$ 500	\$ 500	\$ 400	\$ 400	\$ 950	\$ 950	\$ 162	\$ 162	\$ 750	\$ 750	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,315.0	\$ 2,315.0	\$ 2,150.0	\$ 2,150.0	\$ 2,000.0	\$ 2,000.0	\$ 250	\$ 250	\$ 1,200.0	\$ 1,200.0	\$ 250	\$ 250			
#1-19	FALSE	Explorator	\$	1	\$ 3,000.0	\$ 3,000.0	\$ 700.75	\$ 700.75	\$ 1,500.0	\$ 1,500.0	\$ 400	\$ 400	\$ 950	\$ 950	\$ 195	\$ 195	\$ 750	\$ 750	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15,698.0	\$ 15,698.0	\$ 1,700.0	\$ 1,700.0	\$ 3,200.0	\$ 3,200.0	\$ 250	\$ 250	\$ 1,800.0	\$ 1,800.0	\$ 1,500.0	\$ 1,500.0			
#1-20	FALSE	Explorator	\$	2	\$ 1,600.0	\$ 3,200.0	\$ 700.76	\$ 1,401.52	\$ 250	\$ 500	\$ 400	\$ 800	\$ 2,600.0	\$ 5,200.0	\$ 150	\$ 300	\$ 750	\$ 1,500.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,963.0	\$ 3,926.0	\$ 1,700.0	\$ 3,400.0	\$ 1,600.0	\$ 3,200.0	\$ 250	\$ 500	\$ 1,200.0	\$ 2,400.0	\$ 250	\$ 500			
#1-21	FALSE	Explorator	\$	1	\$ 1,600.0	\$ 1,600.0	\$ 350.37	\$ 350.37	\$ 500	\$ 500	\$ 400	\$ 400	\$ 950	\$ 950	\$ 167	\$ 167	\$ 750	\$ 750	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,963.0	\$ 1,963.0	\$ 1,700.0	\$ 1,700.0	\$ 1,800.0	\$ 1,800.0	\$ 250	\$ 250	\$ 1,200.0	\$ 1,200.0	\$ 350	\$ 350			
#1-22	FALSE	Explorator	\$	1	\$ 1,600.0	\$ 1,600.0	\$ 171.99	\$ 171.99	\$ 250	\$ 250	\$ 170	\$ 170	\$ 4,900.0	\$ 4,900.0	\$ 500	\$ 500	\$ 750	\$ 750	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6,699.0	\$ 6,699.0	\$ 1,700.0	\$ 1,700.0	\$ 2,000.0	\$ 2,000.0	\$ 250	\$ 250	\$ 1,200.0	\$ 1,200.0	\$ 750	\$ 750			
#1-23	FALSE	Mobilizati	\$	1	\$ 16,600.0	\$ 16,600.0	\$ 3,539.03	\$ 3,539.03	\$ 5,000.0	\$ 5,000.0	\$ 10,535.0	\$ 10,535.0	\$ 35,000.0	\$ 35,000.0	\$ 40,000.0	\$ 40,000.0	\$ 2,500.0	\$ 2,500.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 40,250.0	\$ 40,250.0	\$ 5,500.0	\$ 5,500.0	\$ 8,000.0	\$ 8,000.0	\$ 20,125.0	\$ 20,125.0	\$ 15,000.0	\$ 15,000.0	\$ 12,250.0	\$ 12,250.0			
#1-24	FALSE	Gravel Roa	\$	500	\$ 33	\$ 16,500.0	\$ 27.78	\$ 13,890.0	\$ 15	\$ 7,500.0	\$ 20	\$ 10,000.0	\$ 85	\$ 42,500.0	\$ 13	\$ 6,500.0	\$ 20	\$ 10,000.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7	\$ 3,500.0	\$ 14.5	\$ 7,250.0	\$ 25	\$ 12,500.0	\$ 17	\$ 8,500.0	\$ 15	\$ 7,500.0	\$ 8	\$ 4,000.0			
#1-25	FALSE	Blowoff Va	\$	1	\$ 3,100.0	\$ 3,100.0	\$ 2,516.12	\$ 2,516.12	\$ 2,500.0	\$ 2,500.0	\$ 1,885.0	\$ 1,885.0	\$ 3,000.0	\$ 3,000.0	\$ 1,130.0	\$ 1,130.0	\$ 2,000.0	\$ 2,000.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,875.0	\$ 2,875.0	\$ 3,775.0	\$ 3,775.0	\$ 2,600.0	\$ 2,600.0	\$ 2,322.0	\$ 2,322.0	\$ 5,000.0	\$ 5,000.0	\$ 1,950.0	\$ 1,950.0			
#1-26	FALSE	16" x 6" x	\$	1	\$ 17,000.0	\$ 17,000.0	\$ 9,167.96	\$ 9,167.96	\$ 9,000.0	\$ 9,000.0	\$ 9,500.0	\$ 9,500.0	\$ 9,000.0	\$ 9,000.0	\$ 11,620.0	\$ 11,620.0	\$ 8,000.0	\$ 8,000.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15,830.0	\$ 15,830.0	\$ 8,000.0	\$ 8,000.0	\$ 6,900.0	\$ 6,900.0	\$ 9,892.0	\$ 9,892.0	\$ 19,000.0	\$ 19,000.0	\$ 10,535.0	\$ 10,535.0			
#1-27	FALSE	Roadway H	\$	110	\$ 141	\$ 15,510.0	\$ 101.49	\$ 11,163.9	\$ 80	\$ 8,800.0	\$ 105	\$ 11,550.0	\$ 220	\$ 24,200.0	\$ 23	\$ 2,530.0	\$ 50	\$ 5,500.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,594.0	\$ 285,340.0	\$ 90	\$ 9,900.0	\$ 54	\$ 5,940.0	\$ 21	\$ 2,310.0	\$ 50	\$ 5,500.0	\$ 29.25	\$ 3,217.5			