

Items	UnitofMeasure	QuantityRequired	Comment	CHEMRITE, INC.		CITCO Water		George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.		Hawkins, Inc.		Phoenix Solutions		SAL Chemical		Shannon Chemical Corporation		Univar Solutions USA LLC		
				UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice
Base Bid Pricing (11)																				
Calcium Hypochlorite Tablets	\$ Per lb.	300	60 lb. Containers	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.317	\$ 995.1	\$ 8.5095	\$ 2,552.85	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.26	\$ 1,278.0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Carus 4200 DR 400 Orthophosphate	\$ Per Gal	2580	189 lb. Drums	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 21.1783	\$ 54,640.014	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 11.34	\$ 29,257.2	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 27.17	\$ 70,098.6	\$ 18.61	\$ 48,013.8	
Caustic Soda (30% by weight)	\$ Per Gal	7800	Bulk Delivery	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.752	\$ 21,465.6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.94	\$ 15,132.0	\$ 2	\$ 15,600.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.3	\$ 17,940.0	
Gaseous Chlorine	\$ Per lb.	11250	150 lb. Cylinders	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.573	\$ 17,696.25	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.5	\$ 16,875.0	\$ 1.49	\$ 16,762.5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.748	\$ 42,165.0	
DeIPAC 2020	\$ Per Gal	16000	Bulk Delivery	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.59	\$ 57,440.0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.8	\$ 60,800.0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.75	\$ 60,000.0	
DeIPAC 2020	\$ Per lb.	5500	550 lb. Barrels	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.35	\$ 1,924.9999999999998	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.39	\$ 2,145.0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Potassium Permanganate (Dry)	\$ Per lb.	7260	330 lb. Drums	\$ 2.37	\$ 17,206.2	\$ 4.93	\$ 35,791.799999999996	\$ 3.5808	\$ 25,996.608	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.56	\$ 18,585.600000000002	\$ 2.8	\$ 20,328.0	\$ 2.47	\$ 17,932.2	\$ 4.71	\$ 34,194.6	Univar only domestic product
Potassium Permanganate (Dry)	\$ Per lb.	660	55 lb. Pails	\$ 2.37	\$ 1,564.2	\$ 5.127	\$ 3,383.8199999999997	\$ 9.3866	\$ 6,195.156	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.56	\$ 1,689.6000000000001	\$ 2.8	\$ 1,847.9999999999998	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Liquid Sodium Hypochlorite (12.5% by weight)	\$ Per lb.	1368	152 lb. Drums	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.733	\$ 1,002.744	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.4745	\$ 649.116	\$ 0.5	\$ 684.0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Powdered Activated Carbon	\$ Per lb.	13200	50 lb. Bags	\$ 1.49	\$ 19,668.0	\$ 1.6	\$ 21,120.0	\$ 1.4029	\$ 18,518.28	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.25	\$ 16,500.0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
EarthTec QZ	Gallon	450	300 lb. Drum	\$ 19.89	\$ 8,950.5	\$ 11.98	\$ 5,391.0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.98	\$ 12,141.0	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 21.6642	\$ 9,748.9	